BID OPENING MINUTES March 5, 2024 4:00 P.M.

Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement Manager

The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall

WATER/WASTEWATER CHEMICALS								
Vendor:	Liquid Chlorine:	Zinc Orthophosphate:	Hydrofluorosilicic Acid 23%:	Gulbrandsen 6801 2,000 Gal.:	Gulbrandsen 6801 4,000 Gal.:	CWT ST-600 Coastal:	Sodium Permanganate:	Period of Time Prices Firm For:
Sterling Technologies Water, LLC	No Bid	\$0.8286/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	April 2025
JCI Jones Chemical Co.	\$0.914/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Year
Shannon Chemical Corp.	No Bid	\$1.17/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.92/lb	1 Year
Costal Water Technology, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.28/lb	No Bid	N/A
Chem Rite, Inc,	No Bid	\$1.11/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.18/lb totes 1.43 700 gal bulk	N/A
Brenntag Midsouth	\$0.9445/lb	\$0.9370/lb	\$0.3650/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.6270/gal	1 Year
Pennco	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.2335/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Year
Univar Solutions USA, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.2700/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Year
Carus LLC	No Bid	\$0.77/lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Year
USALCO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6400/lb	\$0.5900/lb	No Bid	No Bid	1 Year

The submitted bids will be evaluated and a recommendation made at a later date.